
 

WE WILL BRING DOWN THE PATRIARCHY AND THE STATE THAT CONDEMNS US TO VIOLENCE 

ON NOVEMBER 25TH WE ARE ON THE STREETS! 

While wars all over the world are claiming the lives of 
tens of thousands of people, the danger of a new world 
war is growing rapidly. We welcome "November 25, 
International Day for the Elimination of Violence against 
Women" at a time when the lives of the peoples of the 
world, especially women and children, are made more 
difficult every day, and all forms of violence are 
becoming more and present in our lives. 

Racist Policies are Produced through Women; 

Fascist-racist parties such as AfD, which are on the rise 
in Europe today, produce their anti-immigrant-refugee, 
racist policies through the female body, while blending 
and distorting them with the current problems of society 
and trying to gain a base.   

In reality, they are planning to redesign the social lives 
of women, whom they see as incubators and want to pull 
out of the production areas and lock them at home, 
through the 3K policies of Hitler and Mussolini.  

In this way, they want to make women the bearers of 
racist policies and dependent on men, to distance them 
from social struggle, to turn them into submissive 
beings. They know that it is easy to control a society 
whose women are subjugated. On the other hand, with 
this policy, they want to weaken and cripple the social 
struggle by cutting off a very important pillar of the 
opposition movement 

The Right to Abortion is Being Usurped; 

All fascist-racist parties, especially the Pope and the 
Churches, define abortion as "murder" and doctors who 
perform abortions as "murderers for hire". By attacking 
the "RIGHT TO ABORTION", which is the achievement 
of more than a hundred years of struggles, they are 
trying to ignore the women's struggle while forcing 
women to give birth to cheap labor and soldiers who 
take and give life in wars. 

Equal Pay for Equal Work  

As the purchasing power of the peoples worsens every 
day, it would not be wrong to say that the gap in wage 
inequality will widen further and women's poverty will 
increase, since women will be the first to be hit by layoffs 
in production areas, especially in the automotive 
industry in Germany. For migrant women workers and 
laborers, inequality on this front has always been much 

greater. 

The armament budgets, which are constantly increased 
for imperialist wars, are provided by cutting the wages 
of workers and laborers through taxes, from the budgets 
allocated for the vital needs of the people such as 
health, education, pensions, unemployment. 

Violence against Women on the Rise 

In this period when the danger of the 3rd Imperialist War 
of Sharing is on the rise, murders of women and children 
are on the rise worldwide. According to the UN report, In 
2022, approximately 48,800 women and girls were killed 
by their husbands or the men closest to them. In 
Germany, the number of femicides was 113 in 2021, 163 
in 2023 and 146 in the first 10 months of 2024. Data 
showing that 134 women were murdered in France, 109 
in Italy, 28 in Austria and 17 in Switzerland show the rise 
in femicides. We know that this data is only the tip of the 
iceberg.   

Rapes are Weapons of Imperialist War 

The traumas resulting from torture against women such 
as harassment, rape and the commodification of 
women's bodies, which are used as weapons of war, are 
passed down from generation to generation for years 
after the war. 

It is during these times that child pornography and organ 
mafias steal the lives of our children the most.  

Let's Strengthen the Front of Struggle;  

This year, on November 25th, we must take to the 
streets together, native and immigrant women alike, to 
strengthen the international women's struggle and to 
shout our slogans more loudly. While wars are inevitable 
as long as imperialism exists, the only power that can 
prevent it is the struggle of the peoples of the world. 
Therefore, we must be strong subjects of the struggle 
against imperialism and war.  

This year, we will fill the fields not with our victimizations, 
but with the revolutionary resilience of the women who 
overthrew the Russian Tsar in February 1917, and the 
Mirabel sisters, who overthrew the Dominican dictator in 
1960. 

Long Live Our International Women's Struggle!
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